
EXCLUSIVELY FOR INDUSTRIAL & INSTITUTIONAL USE

KEEP OUT OF REACH OF CHILDREN
CAUTION

See Additional Cautions On Side PanelNET CONTENTS: 6 GALLONS

To Reorder Call (281) 647-9700 or
1-800-295-BETA

Product Code: 2075-P

BETA TECHNOLOGY, INC.
CORPORATE HEADQUARTERS

P.O. BOX 218686 • HOUSTON, TX 77218

FLEET FLUID
WINDSHIELD SOLVENT

CONCENTRATE

FLEET FLUID is specifically de-
signed for fleet usage. A special
blend of surfactants, emulsifiers and
solvents breakdown roadfilm, oil,
mud, dirt and insects.

It is non-streaking and concentrated,
therefore ideally suited for any ser-
vice fleet. FLEET FLUID can be used
in areas subject to extreme weather
conditions when used as directed.

FLEET FLUID
Windshield Solvent

Concentrate
•Extreme Weather Performance to
-29º Below Zero •Non-Filming

•Removes Roadfilm, Grunge, Oil,
Mud & Insects

•Anti-Static Formula Specifically
Designed for Fleet Usage.

DIRECTIONS FOR USE

Windshield solvent concentrate
dilution schedule:

Fleet Part Freeze
Fluid Per Water Range

1 0 -29° F
1 1   3° F
1 2 15° F
1 3 21° F
1 6 28° F

WARNING

WARNING:
FLAMMABLE LIQUID AND VAPOR

Flammable liquid and vapor. Causes 
serious eye irritation.  
Keep away from heat, sparks, open 
flames, and hot surfaces. –No smok-
ing. Keep container tightly closed. 
Wear eye protection. If on skin (or 
hair): Take off immediately all contami-
nated clothing. Rinse skin with water or 
shower. In case of fire use dry chemi-
cal, foam, or carbon dioxide. Store in a 
well-ventilated place. Keep cool. 
Dispose of contents and container in 
accordance with local, state, and 
national regulations. Wash hands 
thoroughly after handling.  If in eyes: 
Rinse cautiously with water for several 
minutes. Remove contact lenses, if 
present and easy to do. Continue 
rinsing. If eye irritation persists: Get 
medical advice or attention.  

For large quantities:
Ground or bond container and receiv-
ing equipment.  Use explosion-proof 
electrical, ventilating, and lighting 
equipment. Use only non-sparking 
tools. Take precautionary measures 
against static discharge.

HMIS CODES: Health – 1; Flamma-
bility – 2; Reactivity – 0; Personal 
Protection – A .                     Made in USA


